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Minutes taken by C. Robidoux 

BAC Attendees: Gary Scholl (Chair BAC), Gail Cromwell (BAC), Christine Robidoux (BAC), Mike 
Darnell (BAC), Steve Concordia (BAC) 
Absent: John Kieley (BAC) 
 
Select Board Attendees: Ken Caisse (BAC/SB), George Willard (SB), Bill Ezell (SB) 
 
Meeting called to order at 3:30 PM 
 
Review of Minutes from Jan 15 2020 meeting. Minutes approved with one amendment. 
 
Resolve/Update Budget Line Items 
Town Administration Office Equipment 

 The shredder was purchased in 2019 so can come off the 2020 Budget. 
 New Telephone system still has some outstanding issues to resolve. May be a $75 

charge in 2020.  
 
An estimate was received for the Town Report for $2900 (Moderator). 
 
An e-mail was received from the Holiday Lighting Committee requesting $2200. 
 
Treasurer requesting office equipment. Recommended to follow-up with Select Board. 
Recommended budget of $500. 
 
Data Processing keep at $5000. 
 
Select Board approved Tax Collector request for increase to $800 for Deputy Tax Collector. 
 
Willard recommends increase for webmaster to $3000. 
 
BAC recommends increase in Abatements since this is a ReVal year to $30,000. 
 
BAC recommends Auditing to $11,500. 
 
Select Board recommends increase in Legal Expenses Town Attorney to $18,000. 
 
The Select Board will be reviewing the Health Insurance strategy in 2020. They may offer an 
opt-in option. 
 
*A Planning Board Admin has not yet been hired. Budget to $1875. 
 
Government Buildings Custodial services to $9700 based on 2019 expenses. 
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Town Hall Repairs and Maintenance needs increase due to floor needed to be redone.  Budget 
to $7000. 
 
Municipal Building Repairs and Maintenance to $11,500 to address rot around the windows, 
per Caisse. 
 
Insurance Property and Liability received at $13,030 for 2020. 
 
Primex bill for Workers Comp for 2020 is $9127. 
 
Is the SWRPC amount the same for 2020?  
 
Police Budget to $256,000. 
 
Ambulance Budget received from Wilton, Temple portion $57,798. 
 
Recycling Budget received from Wilton, Temple portion $77,092. 
 
Highway Department Overtime up to $20,000 due to short staff so team putting in extra hours. 
 
Animal Control Wages keep at $3300. 
 
Note of warrant article for lease purchase of agreement of backhoe (CIP) for $38,500. 
 
Caisse following up on Highway Dept Cell Phones. 
 
Community Planning Committee (TCPC) requesting $350 for Broadband mailing. Put under 
Select Board Printing and Advertising. Total of $600. 
 
Next BAC meeting January 29nd at 4:30 PM.  
 
Prior to adjourning, Chairman Scholl lead a brief discussion of expectations for respectfulness 
and misdemeanor in BAC meetings. 
 
Motion to adjourn at 4:30 PM. Unanimous approval. 
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Attachments: 
2020_01_18_WiltonCo_Op_Scholl 
2020_WiltonAmbulanceRecyclingBudgets 
2020_01_21_PrintingTownReport 
2020_01_21_AuditorFees 
2020_01_23_HolidayLighting_CKieley 
2020_01_27-PBTaxMaps_Pickman 
2020_01_27_Updates_Scholl 
2020_01_27_VG_RailsOnCommon_CKieley 
2020_01_23_AdjustPrimex_Scholl 
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Gary Scholl

From: Board Assistant <boardassistant@templenh.org>
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 1:55 PM
To: Gary Scholl
Subject: Re: BAC Agenda for 22Jan2020 3:30p

Gary, 
 
The 2020 Audit fees are $11,500.00 
 
Carole 
 
On Thu, Jan 16, 2020 at 3:36 PM Gary Scholl <gwscholl@gmail.com> wrote: 

BAC, 

At our BAC meeting yesterday, it was decided that we would require an additional meeting to be held on 22 January. 
That agenda is attached.  

  

Per our discussion, I have sent a note to Peter Allen requesting that he request an agenda item to meet with the SB at 
their next meeting regarding the desk and scanner needs. I have also requested missing contractual values from Carol 
Singelais.  

  

The “first pass” budget is attached per our consolidation review yesterday.  

  

Carol, 

Please post hard copies of the attached agenda at the appropriate locations and pass on an electronic version to our 
webmaster. 

  

SB, 

FYI 

g 
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Daniel LaSalle (painting contractor)

130 summer st
peterborough, NH  03458 US
ldlasalle11@aol.com

quote
ADDRESS

Connie Kieley

QUOTE # 1045
DATE 01/27/2020

  

ACTIVITY QTY RATE AMOUNT

exterior painting
Rails at Temple Common (including two 
benches)-

     hand wash as needed 
     scrape / sand all loose and peeling paint
     primer at all exposed wood
     one coat Benjamin Moore "moorgard" white 
(low lustre finish)

1 2,800.00 2,800.00

 

TOTAL $2,800.00

Accepted By Accepted Date
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Gary Scholl

From: Board Assistant <boardassistant@templenh.org>
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 9:16 AM
To: Gary Scholl
Subject: Primex

Gary, 
 
I just saw another Primex bill for Unemployment compensation for 2020.   
The contribution amount due is $500.00 but we have a credit balance of ($101.78) so we are paying $398.22. 
 
 
--  
Carole Singelais 

Assistant to the Select Board 

Town of Temple, NH 

603.878.2536 
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